Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory Billerica Winwater Works EJ Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb John Hoadley and Sons
January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m. 2 Everett Farmer Road 210 Sheep Davis Road 1 Chester Rd. 71 Rockingham Rd. 672 Union Street
Billerica, MA 01821 Concord, NH 03301 Raymond, NH 03077 Londonderry, NH 03053 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 978-670-4771 P: 603-224-9545 P: 603-895-2282 P: 603-432-6393 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Gregory Lindquist Attn: Joe Cameron Attn: David Dembkoski Attn: William Alois Attn: Michael Hoadley
glindquist@winwaterworks.com  |joe.cameron@ejprescott.com |david.dembkoski@ferguson.com ALO@fwwebb.com srogers@hoadleyandsons.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
1) Flushing Hydrants
3/4" x 5' Bury No Bid No Bid Kupferle #77 | $ 704.29 No Bid No Bid
1" x 5' Bury No Bid No Bid Kupferle #77 | $ 704.29 No Bid No Bid
2" x 5' Bury No Bid No Bid Kupferle #77 | $ 704.29 No Bid No Bid
2 1/2" x 5' Bury No Bid No Bid Kupferle #77 | $ 704.29 No Bid No Bid
2) Fire Hydrants
5 1/4" x 5' Bury $ 1,919.00 $ 2,568.00 | Kennedyks1 | $ 1,966.22 |kennedy $ 1,958.00 No Bid
51/4" x 5 1/2' Bury $ 1,961.00 $ 2,668.00 | Kennedyks1 | $ 2,009.16 [kennedy $ 2,003.00 No Bid
51/4" x 6' Bury S 2,004.00 S 2,688.00 | Kennedy k81 | $ 2,052.10 |kennedy S 2,047.00 No Bid
5 1/4" x 6 1/2' Bury $ 2,046.00 $ 2,688.00 | Kennedyks1 | $ 2,095.05 [kennedy $ 2,089.00 No Bid
3) Fire Hydrants Inserts
Fire Hydrant inserts removed from bid
4) Hydrant Elbows
6" for 4" Hydrant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" for 4 1" Hydrant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" for 5" Hydrant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" for 5 ¥4" Hydrant S 1,151.00 No Bid No Bid kennedy S 1,020.00 No Bid
5) Hydrant Extensions complete
6" S 459.00 No Bid Kennedy S 480.00 |kennedy S 460.00 No Bid
12" S 536.00 No Bid Kennedy S 560.00 |kennedy S 537.00 No Bid
18" S 608.00 No Bid Kennedy S 636.00 |kennedy S 610.00 No Bid
24" S 661.00 No Bid Kennedy S 691.00 |kennedy S 661.00 No Bid
6) Ground Frost Sleeves for use on Bury
5' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51/2' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 %%’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7) Breakaway kit for K-11 Kennedy
Hydrants 5 1/4" Opening S 332.00 No Bid Kennedy S 325.00 S 332.00 No Bid
8) Breakaway Kit for K-81A Kennedy
Hydrants 5 1/4" Opening S 208.00 No Bid Kennedy S 283.00 S 220.00 No Bid
9) Coupling for K-81A Breakaway 5 1/4" Opening S 99.00 No Bid No Bid S 120.00 No Bid
Coupling for K-11 Breakaway 5 1/4" Opening S 116.00 No Bid No Bid S 138.00 No Bid
10) Sampling Station 3/4" X 5' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11) Tapping Gate Valves & Tapping
Sleeves Complete
4x4 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 996.84 No Bid No Bid S 848.45
6x6 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 1,276.84 No Bid No Bid S 1,103.09
6x4 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 1,376.98 No Bid No Bid S 839.91
8x8 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 1,594.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,562.05
8x6 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 1,564.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,105.79
8x4 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 1,538.00 No Bid No Bid S 869.00
10x10 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 2,632.00 No Bid No Bid S 2,437.76
10x8 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 2,432.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,566.02
10x6 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 2,418.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,121.65
10x4 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 2,398.00 No Bid No Bid S 885.55
12x12 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 3,667.00 No Bid No Bid S 3,399.57
12x10 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 3,600.00 No Bid No Bid S 2,469.11
12x8 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 3,572.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,600.40
12x6 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 3,481.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,157.41
12x4 No Bid AFC & ROMAC | $ 3,398.00 No Bid No Bid S 909.38
20x8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 2,129.90
20x6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,596.23
20x4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,353.42
12) Gate Valves
4" No Bid AFC S 509.00 | Clow S 481.02 S 460.00 S 445.00
6" No Bid AFC S 637.00 | Clow S 610.32 S 585.00 S 549.57
8" No Bid AFC S 998.00 | Clow S 957.15 S 926.00 S 859.42
10" No Bid AFC S 1,508.00 | Clow S 1,486.62 S 1,414.00 S 1,328.08
12" No Bid AFC S 1,998.00 | Clow S 1,898.11 S 1,801.00 S 1,690.32
13) Gate Boxes Complete
Gate Box complete No Bid BIBBY S 148.00 | Pro Select | $ 80.55 S 80.00 S 63.11
Gate Box Top No Bid BIBBY S 76.00 | Pro Select S 33.87 No Bid S 27.27
Gate Box Bottom No Bid BIBBY S 56.00 | Pro Select S 38.82 No Bid S 31.82
Gate Box Cover No Bid BIBBY S 16.00 | Pro Select | $ 7.86 No Bid S 9.38
13a) Valve Box Adaptor Il No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13b) Gate Box Bottom extra long No Bid No Bid No Bid 60"LONG |$ 138.00 S 49.89
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ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
14) 1" Gate Box Risers
1" with cover No Bid BIBBY S 30.00 No Bid No Bid S 14.49
1" without cover No Bid BIBBY S 14.00 No Bid No Bid S 5.11
15) Gate Box Risers
2" with cover No Bid BIBBY S 32.00 No Bid No Bid S 17.90
2" without cover No Bid BIBBY S 16.00 No Bid No Bid S 8.52
3" with cover No Bid BIBBY S 35.00 No Bid No Bid S 22.22
3" without cover No Bid BIBBY S 19.00 No Bid No Bid S 12.84
16) Gate Box Adaptors 2 1/2" - 12
Gate Box Adaptors w/cover No Bid BIBBY S 62.99 No Bid No Bid S 26.42
Gate Box Adaptors without cover No Bid BIBBY S 46.99 No Bid No Bid S 17.05
16a) Gate Box Adaptors 2/12" - 18
Gate Box Adaptors w/cover No Bid BIBBY S 71.99 No Bid No Bid S 31.25
Gate Box Adaptors without cove No Bid BIBBY S 55.99 No Bid No Bid S 21.88
16b) Complete Megalug Gland Kits
4" No Bid ROMAC S 31.28 No Bid ebaa S 33.00 S 27.36
6" No Bid ROMAC S 34.60 No Bid ebaa S 41.00 S 34.04
8" No Bid ROMAC S 47.40 No Bid ebaa S 55.00 S 46.20
10" No Bid ROMAC S 66.65 No Bid ebaa S 78.00 S 66.01
12" No Bid ROMAC S 111.66 No Bid ebaa S 105.00 S 88.48
14” No Bid ROMAC S 158.89 No Bid ebaa S 150.00 S 110.96
16” No Bid ROMAC S 188.31 No Bid ebaa S 180.00 S 151.19
18" No Bid ROMAC S 264.81 No Bid ebaa S 284.00 S 202.76
17) Cutting-In Sleeve
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 265.00
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 363.00
8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 470.00
10" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 595.00
12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 699.00
18) Cutting-In Gate
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,180.00
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,600.00
8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 2,475.00
10" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19) Plug
4" No Bid SIP S 52.73 | Tyler Union | $ 24.27 No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid SIp S 75.95 | Tyler Union | $ 42.53 No Bid No Bid
8" No Bid SIp S 108.53 | Tyler Union | S 58.93 No Bid No Bid
10" No Bid SIp S 66.65 | Tyler Union | $ 98.99 No Bid No Bid
12" No Bid SIp S 217.66 | Tyler Union | $ 98.81 No Bid No Bid
20) Caps
4" No Bid SIp S 48.69 [ Tyler Union | $ 40.06 |star S 65.00 S 43.06
6" No Bid SIp S 65.88 | Tyler Union | $ 56.39 [star S 84.00 S 61.55
8" No Bid SIP S 98.46 | Tyler Union | $ 83.41 |star S 123.00 S 90.91
10" No Bid SIp S 130.79 | Tyler Union | S 114.67 |star S 175.00 S 122.16
12" No Bid SIp S 207.61 | Tyler Union | $ 165.24 |star S 229.00 S 172.17
21) Caps (With IP Tap)
4" with 2" IP Tap No Bid SIp S 67.86 | Tyler Union | $ 55.01 [star S 91.00 S 59.06
6" with 2" IP Tap No Bid SIp S 84.96 | Tyler Union | $ 71.33 |[star S 110.00 S 77.55
8" with 2" IP Tap No Bid SIp S 117.02 | Tyler Union | S 97.98 |[star S 150.00 S 106.51
10" with 2" IP Tap No Bid SIp S 149.35 | Tyler Union | S 129.24 |star S 205.00 S 137.76
12" with 2" IP Tap No Bid SIp S 226.71 | Tyler Union | $ 180.19 |star S 255.00 S 188.17
22) Reducers
6x4 No Bid SIp S 110.41 | Tyler Union | $ 93.09 |[star S 133.00 S 101.01
8x4 No Bid SIP S 139.81 | Tyler Union | $ 117.50 |star S 181.00 S 127.57
8Xx6 No Bid SIp S 146.24 | Tyler Union | S 125.98 |star S 197.00 S 137.66
10x 4 No Bid SIp S 166.31 | Tyler Union | $ 171.44 |star S 221.00 S 180.02
10x 6 No Bid SIP S 197.54 | Tyler Union | $ 155.80 |star S 227.00 S 173.72
10x 8 No Bid SIp S 205.93 | Tyler Union | $ 179.77 |star S 252.00 S 193.47
12x4 No Bid SIP S 269.64 | Tyler Union | $ 215.39 |[star S 332.00 S 226.03
12x6 No Bid SIp S 257.06 | Tyler Union | $ 208.55 |star S 355.00 S 219.72
12x 8 No Bid SIp S 272.14 | Tyler Union | $ 221.75 |star S 361.00 S 234.28
12x 10 No Bid SIP S 303.25 | Tyler Union | $ 252.64 |star S 374.00 S 265.13
23) Tapping Saddles (CC)
2XxX % No Bid ROMAC S 48.17 No Bid No Bid S 14.18
2x1 No Bid ROMAC S 48.17 No Bid No Bid S 14.18
4x3/4 No Bid ROMAC S 48.51 No Bid No Bid S 19.14
4x1 No Bid ROMAC S 48.51 No Bid No Bid S 19.14
4x11/4 No Bid ROMAC S 51.93 No Bid No Bid S 24.22
4x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 51.93 No Bid No Bid S 24.99
4x2 No Bid ROMAC S 54.24 No Bid No Bid S 24.99
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Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
6 x 3/4 No Bid ROMAC S 54.24 No Bid No Bid S 24.51
6x1 No Bid ROMAC S 58.05 No Bid No Bid S 24.51
6x11/4 No Bid ROMAC S 58.05 No Bid No Bid S 29.82
6x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 61.46 No Bid No Bid S 30.22
6x2 No Bid ROMAC S 61.46 No Bid No Bid S 30.22
8x3/4 No Bid ROMAC S 64.84 No Bid No Bid S 26.77
8x1 No Bid ROMAC S 64.84 No Bid No Bid S 26.77
8x11/4 No Bid ROMAC S 64.84 No Bid No Bid S 33.39
8x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 64.84 No Bid No Bid S 33.39
8x2 No Bid ROMAC S 64.84 No Bid No Bid S 33.39
10 x 3/4 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 34.59
10x 1 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 34.59
10x11/4 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 44.03
10x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 44.03
10x2 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 44.03
12x 3/4 No Bid ROMAC S 73.34 No Bid No Bid S 41.49
12x1 No Bid ROMAC S 82.33 No Bid No Bid S 41.49
12x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 82.33 No Bid No Bid S 51.74
12x14x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 82.33 No Bid No Bid S 70.39
12x2 No Bid ROMAC S 82.33 No Bid No Bid S 52.79
16x11/2 No Bid ROMAC S 177.88 No Bid No Bid S 92.22
16 x 2 No Bid ROMAC S 177.88 No Bid No Bid S 95.81
20X ¥ No Bid ROMAC S 177.88 No Bid No Bid S 101.06
20x1 No Bid ROMAC S 194.88 No Bid No Bid S 101.06
20x 1Y No Bid ROMAC S 194.88 No Bid No Bid S 115.92
20x1% No Bid ROMAC S 194.88 No Bid No Bid S 115.92
20x2 No Bid ROMAC S 194.88 No Bid No Bid S 115.92
24) M.J. Hydrant Tee, Ductile Iron
6x6 No Bid SIP S 393.31 | Tyler Union | $ 174.00 |star S 261.00 S 177.90
8x6 No Bid SIP S 505.11 | Tyler Union | $ 222.07 |star S 335.00 S 230.21
10x6 No Bid SIP S 549.34 | Tyler Union | $ 298.02 |star S 511.00 S 307.13
12x6 No Bid SIP S 1,278.51 | Tyler Union | $ 370.76 |star S 621.00 S 376.74
25) Tees
4x4x4 No Bid SIp S 193.17 | Tyler Union | $ 127.27 |star S 183.00 S 136.78
6x6x4 No Bid SIP S 258.84 No Bid star S 269.00 S 185.37
6Xx6x6 No Bid SIP S 290.73 | Tyler Union | $ 182.63 |star S 277.00 S 199.06
8x8x4 No Bid SIP S 322.88 No Bid star S 388.00 S 224.87
8x8x6 No Bid SIP S 360.94 No Bid star S 390.00 S 246.57
8x8x8 No Bid SIP S 415.34 | Tyler Union | $ 259.97 |star S 394.00 S 283.12
10x10x 4 No Bid SIP S 448.77 No Bid star S 588.00 S 318.99
10x10x6 No Bid SIP S 471.33 No Bid star S 611.00 S 321.08
10x10x8 No Bid SIP S 515.88 No Bid star S 624.00 S 359.23
10x 10 x 10 No Bid SIP S 674.88 | Tyler Union | $ 379.51 |star S 641.00 S 404.49
12x12x4 No Bid SIP S 698.77 No Bid star S 762.00 S 400.20
12x12x 6 No Bid SIP S 745.77 No Bid star S 778.00 S 407.09
12x12x8 No Bid SIP S 736.12 No Bid star S 803.00 S 448.45
12x12x 10 No Bid SIP S 790.13 No Bid star S 835.00 S 530.90
12x12x 12 No Bid SIp S 843.77 | Tyler Union | $ 530.09 |star S 841.00 S 553.31
25a) Solid Sleeves
4" No Bid SIP S 109.88 | Tyler Union | $ 84.30 |star S 128.00 S 91.72
6" No Bid SIp S 155.99 | Tyler Union | $ 118.38 |star S 174.00 S 129.10
8" No Bid SIP S 229.07 | Tyler Union | $ 175.06 |star S 231.00 S 190.61
10” No Bid SIP S 300.38 | Tyler Union | $ 234.57 |star S 340.00 S 249.93
12" No Bid SIP S 403.80 | Tyler Union | $ 322.63 |star S 457.00 S 335.94
16" No Bid SIP S 752.87 | Tyler Union | $ 580.89 |star S 985.00 S 605.04
26) Elbows
4" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid SIp S 148.42 No Bid star S 131.00 S 86.52
4" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid SIP S 152.44 No Bid star S 131.00 S 87.72
4" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid SIP S 156.04 | Tyler Union | S 83.11 |[star S 131.00 S 89.32
4" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid SIp S 168.46 No Bid star S 131.00 S 96.12
6" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid SIP S 180.17 No Bid star S 187.00 S 120.30
6" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid SIP S 197.84 No Bid star S 187.00 S 118.30
6" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid SIP S 197.84 | Tyler Union | S 112.78 |star S 187.00 S 123.10
6" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid SIP S 197.84 No Bid star S 187.00 S 135.10
8" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid SIP S 256.88 No Bid star S 265.00 S 163.41
8" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid SIP S 256.88 No Bid star S 265.00 S 170.21
8" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid SIP S 256.88 | Tyler Union | $ 157.88 |star S 265.00 S 172.21
8" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid SIP S 290.52 No Bid star S 265.00 S 189.41
10" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid SIP S 389.95 No Bid star S 431.00 S 246.33
10" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid SIP S 389.95 No Bid star S 431.00 S 247.13
10" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid SIP S 389.95 | Tyler Union | $ 232.33 |star S 431.00 S 247.53
10" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid SIP S 454.35 No Bid star S 431.00 S 285.53
12" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid SIP S 483.70 No Bid star S 608.00 S 318.74
12" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid SIP S 499.23 No Bid star S 608.00 S 327.94
12" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid SIP S 552.06 | Tyler Union | $ 334.58 |star S 608.00 S 348.74
12" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid SIP S 642.08 No Bid star S 608.00 S 383.54
27) Ductile Iron Pipe price per foot Per Ft.
4" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 26.00 | McWane $ 21.80 |mcwane S 22.85 No Bid
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Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
6" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 20.00 | McWane S 16.75 |mcwane S 17.60 No Bid
8" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 26.00 | McWane S 23.64 |mcwane S 27.71 No Bid
10" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 34.00 | McWane S 31.72 |mcwane S 32.53 No Bid
12" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 44.00 | McWane S 39.02 |mcwane S 40.97 No Bid
16" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 62.00 | McWane S 57.81 |mcwane S 59.28 No Bid
20" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid AMERICAN S 82.00 | McWane S 75.89 |mcwane S 77.84 No Bid
27a) Poly Bags for Pipe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28) Brass Bushings
1" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 8.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" x 3/4” No Bid AY McDonald | $ 13.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 13.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 19.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x 1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x 1 1/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 1/2"x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
29) Copper Tubing
3/4" S 4.53 |Cambridge S 4,51 No Bid 60' COIL $4.63/ft No Bid
1" S 5.99 |Cambridge S 5.99 No Bid 60' COIL $6.00/ft No Bid
11/4" S 7.67 |Cambridge S 8.70 No Bid 60' COIL $7.50/ft No Bid
11/2" S 9.35 |Cambridge S 9.35 No Bid 60' COIL $10.67/ft No Bid
2" S 14.87 |Cambridge S 14.88 No Bid 40' COIL $14.88/ft No Bid
30) Corporation CC X PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 64.47 No Bid cambridge | $ 59.00 S 46.12
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 68.44 No Bid cambridge | $ 73.00 S 60.67
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 125.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 131.11 No Bid cambridge | $ 165.00 S 136.91
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 216.84 No Bid cambridge | $ 271.00 S 226.42
31) Corporation IP X PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 54.47 No Bid cambtidge | $ 59.00 S 46.12
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 60.48 No Bid cambtidge | $ 73.00 S 60.67
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 131.11 No Bid cambtidge | $ 165.00 S 136.91
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 216.84 No Bid cambtidge | $ 271.00 S 226.42
32) Corporation Stop Coupling
5/8" x 3/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 3/14" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 3/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 1" x 1/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x11/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33) Curb Boxes No Bid Laroche S 50.60 No Bid bibby S 59.00 S 34.60
34) Curb Box Covers No Bid Laroche S 8.00 No Bid bibby S 17.00 S 6.25
35) Buffalo Repair Lids No Bid Laroche S 12.00 No Bid No Bid S 6.59
36) Service Box Plug Cover No Bid Laroche S 9.00 No Bid bibby S 20.00 S 8.75
37) Brass Plug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 3.98
38) Curb Box Footpiece No Bid S 22.50 No Bid bibby S 25.00 S 9.09
39) Curb Box Riser
3" No Bid QWP S 8.00 No Bid general S 12.00 S 6.82
6" No Bid QWP S 9.00 No Bid general S 14.00 S 7.39
12" No Bid QWP S 10.00 No Bid general S 18.00 S 8.52
40) Curb Stop PPJ x PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 60.89 No Bid cambridge | $ 76.00 S 65.33
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 91.53 No Bid cambridge | $ 115.00 S 98.18
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 145.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 219.05 No Bid cambridge | $ 275.00 S 223.48
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 307.94 No Bid cambridge | $ 386.00 S 332.54
41) Curb Stop FIP X FIP
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 47.31 No Bid No Bid S 50.71
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 73.53 No Bid No Bid S 78.80
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 101.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 150.58 No Bid No Bid S 162.58
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 220.23 No Bid No Bid S 237.88
42) Curb Stop FIP X PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 56.37 No Bid No Bid S 57.37



mailto:david.dembkoski@ferguson.com
mailto:ALO@fwwebb.com
mailto:glindquist@winwaterworks.com

Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory Billerica Winwater Works EJ Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb John Hoadley and Sons
January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m. 2 Everett Farmer Road 210 Sheep Davis Road 1 Chester Rd. 71 Rockingham Rd. 672 Union Street
Billerica, MA 01821 Concord, NH 03301 Raymond, NH 03077 Londonderry, NH 03053 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 978-670-4771 P: 603-224-9545 P: 603-895-2282 P: 603-432-6393 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Gregory Lindquist Attn: Joe Cameron Attn: David Dembkoski Attn: William Alois Attn: Michael Hoadley
glindquist@winwaterworks.com  |joe.cameron@ejprescott.com |david.dembkoski@ferguson.com ALO@fwwebb.com srogers@hoadleyandsons.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 82.11 No Bid No Bid S 88.02
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald _[No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 193.03
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 248.65 No Bid No Bid S 268.73
43) Female Adaptor IP X PPJ
3/4" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 14.49 No Bid No Bid S 15.65
1" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 17.08 No Bid No Bid S 18.29
1 1/4" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 32.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 17.27 No Bid No Bid S 18.29
1"x 1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 19.66 No Bid No Bid S 22.38
11/4"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 30.65 No Bid No Bid S 30.70
11/2"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 51.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1 1/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 32.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 35.80 No Bid No Bid S 38.30
11/2"x11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 42.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4"x 11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 57.20 No Bid No Bid S 61.01
2"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 68.11 No Bid No Bid S 72.71
21/2"X21/2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43a) Female Adaptors Brass PPJ x PPJ
3/4" x 1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44) Elbows, Brass
3/4" 45 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 10.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 45' No Bid AY McDonald | $ 17.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" 45 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 27.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" 45 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 34.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 45' No Bid AY McDonald | $ 56.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4"  221/2 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 22 1/2 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" 221/2' No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" 221/2' No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 22 1/2 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 1114 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 11 1/4 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" 1114 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" 1114 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 11 1/4 No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 90 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 90! No Bid AY McDonald | $ 12.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" 90' No Bid AY McDonald | $ 20.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" 90 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 25.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 90" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 41.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid
44a) Elbow Brass, PPJ X PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 21.90
1" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 28.12
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 95.50
2" No Bid AY McDonald [No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 193.20
45) Male Adaptor, IP X PPJ
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 13.78 No Bid No Bid $ 14.61
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 16.33 No Bid No Bid $ 17.25
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 21.22 No Bid No Bid S 33.32
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 44.72 No Bid No Bid S 47.71
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 65.16 No Bid No Bid S 69.52
46) Nipples, Brass
3/4" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21/2" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 4 No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald S 13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald S 17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 6" No Bid AY McDonald S 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory Billerica Winwater Works EJ Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb John Hoadley and Sons
January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m. 2 Everett Farmer Road 210 Sheep Davis Road 1 Chester Rd. 71 Rockingham Rd. 672 Union Street
Billerica, MA 01821 Concord, NH 03301 Raymond, NH 03077 Londonderry, NH 03053 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 978-670-4771 P: 603-224-9545 P: 603-895-2282 P: 603-432-6393 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Gregory Lindquist Attn: Joe Cameron Attn: David Dembkoski Attn: William Alois Attn: Michael Hoadley
glindquist@winwaterworks.com  |joe.cameron@ejprescott.com |david.dembkoski@ferguson.com ALO@fwwebb.com srogers@hoadleyandsons.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
11/2"x6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2%"x6" No Bid AY McDonald | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x 6" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
47) Nipples, close, Brass (Threaded)
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 2.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48) Plug, Brass, CC
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 12.67
1" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 13.37
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 24.94
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 24.00
2" No Bid AY McDonald |No Bid No Bid No Bid S 37.00
49) Plug, Brass (IP)
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50) Coupling, Reducer
1" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2"x11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x 1 1/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"x11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 66.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
51) Cast Coupling - 411 (Body length 6")
3/4" No Bid ROMAC S 34.94 No Bid No Bid S 18.38
1" No Bid ROMAC S 38.61 No Bid No Bid S 19.01
11/4" No Bid ROMAC S 39.89 No Bid No Bid S 19.91
11/2" No Bid ROMAC S 45.75 No Bid No Bid S 23.77
2" No Bid ROMAC S 55.61 No Bid No Bid S 26.93
51a) Hymax Coupling
2" S 96.00 [JROMAC S 113.05 No Bid No Bid S 88.80
4" S 162.00 [ROMAC S 195.20 No Bid No Bid S 150.11
6" S 215.00 JROMAC S 258.12 No Bid No Bid S 198.58
8" S 243.00 JROMAC S 292.30 No Bid No Bid S 224.44
10” S 312.00 |ROMAC S 378.10 No Bid No Bid S 288.74
10"0.s. S 330.00 |ROMAC S 404.28 No Bid No Bid S 311.40
12" S 369.00 JROMAC S 445.00 No Bid No Bid S 340.80
12"0.s. S 441.00 |[ROMAC S 532.00 No Bid No Bid S 415.87
14" S 999.00 |[ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 905.38
14"0.s. No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" S 1,029.00 |[ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 932.96
18" S 1,211.00 [ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,097.93
20" S 1,308.00 [ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,185.74
24" S 1,393.00 |[ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 1,262.59
52) Cast Coupling 441
4" No Bid S 75.83 No Bid No Bid S 49.51
6" No Bid S 103.22 No Bid No Bid S 63.49
8" No Bid S 130.77 No Bid No Bid S 80.26
10" No Bid S 180.43 No Bid No Bid S 111.43
12" No Bid S 217.00 No Bid No Bid S 134.17
14" No Bid S 378.99 No Bid No Bid S 225.74
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory Billerica Winwater Works EJ Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb John Hoadley and Sons
January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m. 2 Everett Farmer Road 210 Sheep Davis Road 1 Chester Rd. 71 Rockingham Rd. 672 Union Street

Billerica, MA 01821 Concord, NH 03301 Raymond, NH 03077 Londonderry, NH 03053 Rockland, MA 02370

P: 978-670-4771 P: 603-224-9545 P: 603-895-2282 P: 603-432-6393 P: 781-878-8098

Attn: Gregory Lindquist Attn: Joe Cameron Attn: David Dembkoski Attn: William Alois Attn: Michael Hoadley

glindquist@winwaterworks.com  |joe.cameron@ejprescott.com |david.dembkoski@ferguson.com ALO@fwwebb.com srogers@hoadleyandsons.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
16" No Bid S 452.96 No Bid No Bid S 300.18
20" No Bid S 791.61 No Bid No Bid S 416.27
53) Transition Coupling DI to AC (All by 6")
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 49.51
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 63.49
8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 79.19
10" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 111.43
12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 134.17
54) Transition Coupling AC to DI
2" x 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 50.90
55) Full Circle Clamp
2" x71/2" No Bid ROMAC S 34.70 No Bid No Bid S 33.37
4" x 7 1/2" No Bid ROMAC S 42.71 No Bid No Bid S 42.77
6" x 7 1/2" No Bid ROMAC S 51.11 No Bid No Bid S 49.87
8"x71/2" No Bid ROMAC S 59.88 No Bid No Bid S 58.31
12"x 7 1/2" No Bid ROMAC S 104.18 No Bid No Bid S 89.81
20" x 7 %" No Bid ROMAC S 298.23 No Bid No Bid S 311.32
4" x 12 1/2" No Bid ROMAC S 67.84 No Bid No Bid S 65.63
6"x 12 1/2" No Bid ROMAC S 81.60 No Bid No Bid S 79.94
8"x121/2" No Bid ROMAC S 96.11 No Bid No Bid S 111.76
10" x 12 %" No Bid ROMAC S 120.44 No Bid No Bid S 118.81
12" x 12 %" No Bid ROMAC S 188.67 No Bid No Bid S 143.85
14" x 12 15" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 376.15
16" x 12 %" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 394.69
18" x 12 15" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 102.52
20" x 12 %" No Bid ROMAC 554.94 No Bid No Bid S 455.95
24" x 12 %" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid S 715.42
4" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 131.55 No Bid No Bid S 132.02
6" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 156.12 No Bid No Bid S 138.25
8" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 178.92 No Bid No Bid S 155.35
10" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 220.89 No Bid No Bid S 189.51
12" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 262.02 No Bid No Bid S 223.58
14" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 638.18 No Bid No Bid S 507.25
16" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 658.77 No Bid No Bid S 524.34
18" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 717.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20" x 20" No Bid ROMAC S 737.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 20" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 10" No Bid ROMAC S 120.72 No Bid No Bid S 99.74
14" x 10" No Bid ROMAC S 358.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" x 10" No Bid ROMAC S 358.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20" x 10" No Bid ROMAC S 398.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 86.73 No Bid No Bid S 72.89
6" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 103.49 No Bid No Bid S 88.00
8" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 126.29 No Bid No Bid S 107.08
10" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 165.46 No Bid No Bid S 137.88
12" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 188.66 No Bid No Bid S 196.34
14" x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 480.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" x 15" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" x 15" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 x 15" No Bid ROMAC S 554.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 15" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24" No Bid ROMAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56) Bell Joint Leak Clamp
4" No Bid ROMAC S 164.00 No Bid No Bid S 97.14
6" No Bid ROMAC S 188.93 No Bid No Bid S 106.98
8" No Bid ROMAC S 215.88 No Bid No Bid S 147.81
10" No Bid ROMAC S 280.95 No Bid No Bid S 185.74
12" No Bid ROMAC S 354.80 No Bid No Bid S 200.89
14" No Bid ROMAC S 652.66 No Bid No Bid S 698.64
16" No Bid ROMAC S 1,564.44 No Bid No Bid S 313.69
20" No Bid ROMAC S 1,991.44 No Bid No Bid S 506.22
57) Union, 3 Piece
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 20.23 No Bid cambridge | $ 27.00 S 17.82
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 23.14 No Bid cambridge | $ 29.00 S 19.44
1Yy No Bid AY McDonald | $ 39.95 No Bid No Bid S 55.67
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 77.43 No Bid cambridge | $ 83.00 S 68.54
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 104.54 No Bid cambridge | $ 110.00 S 92.57
58) Pipe Coupling, IP X IP
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Billerica Winwater Works

EJ Prescott

Ferguson Waterworks

FW Webb

John Hoadley and Sons

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

2 Everett Farmer Road

210 Sheep Davis Road

1 Chester Rd.

71 Rockingham Rd.

672 Union Street

Billerica, MA 01821

Concord, NH 03301

Raymond, NH 03077

Londonderry, NH 03053

Rockland, MA 02370

P:978-670-4771

P: 603-224-9545

P: 603-895-2282

P: 603-432-6393

P: 781-878-8098

Attn: Gregory Lindquist

Attn: Joe Cameron

Attn: David Dembkoski

Attn: William Alois

Attn: Michael Hoadley

glindquist@winwaterworks.com  |joe.cameron@ejprescott.com |david.dembkoski@ferguson.com ALO@fwwebb.com srogers@hoadleyandsons.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
ltem Model Price per each Model Price per each Model Price per each |Model Price per each |Model Price per each
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 11.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 19.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 25.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 42.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 71.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
59) Ball Valves, FIP x FIP
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 47.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 73.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1Y% No Bid AY McDonald | $ 101.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 150.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 220.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60) Caps, Brass
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 38.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
61) Tees, Brass, |.P. Thread
3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" No Bid AY McDonald S 19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 61.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
62) Tees, Brass, PPJ x PPJ X IP
2"x2"x3/4" No Bid AY McDonald | $ 130.41 No Bid No Bid $ 130.00
63) Foster Adaptor with Kit
4" S 71.00 JINFACT S 88.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" S 89.00 |INFACT S 98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" S 129.00 |INFACT $ 148.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" S 189.00 |INFACT S 208.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" S 195.00 JINFACT $ 218.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
64) Rod clamps
4" No Bid SIGMA S 39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid SIGMA S 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" No Bid SIGMA S 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" No Bid SIGMA S 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" No Bid SIGMA S 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
65) 3/4" Duc lugs No Bid SIGMA $ 3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
66) Threaded rod couplings, rod clamp
washer and hex nuts
5/8" x 6' No Bid SIGMA $ 6.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X 6' No Bid SIGMA S 7.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid
66a) Tie bolts
5/8" x 3" No Bid SIGMA S 3.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 4" No Bid SIGMA S 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD

Copy to: Karen Conard, City Manager
Judie Belanger, Finance Director

Peter Rice, Public Works Director

Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director
Jim Tow, General Foreman

Denise Carpenter, Purchasing Coordinator
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each

1) Flushing Hydrants

3/4" x 5' Bury No Bid Kupferle S 732.47

1" x 5' Bury No Bid Kupferle S 732.47

2" x 5' Bury No Bid Kupferle S 732.47

2 1/2" x 5' Bury No Bid Kupferle S 732.47

2) Fire Hydrants see cut sheet

51/4" x 5' Bury No Bid 2780 American| $ 1,950.37

51/4" x 5 1/2' Bury No Bid 2780 American| $ 1,990.99

5 1/4" x 6' Bury No Bid 2780 American| $ 2,031.61

51/4" x 6 1/2' Bury No Bid 2780 American| $ 2,072.24

3) Fire Hydrants Inserts

Fire Hydrant inserts removed from bid

4) Hydrant Elbows

6" for 4" Hydrant No Bid No Bid

6" for 4 1" Hydrant No Bid No Bid

6" for 5" Hydrant No Bid No Bid

6" for 5 ¥4" Hydrant No Bid No Bid

5) Hydrant Extensions complete

6" No Bid 2780 American| S 452.43

12" No Bid 2780 American| S 532.70

18" No Bid 2780 American| S 602.75

24" No Bid 2780 American| S 677.83

Not to bid specs

6) Ground Frost Sleeves for use on Bury

5' No Bid No Bid

51/2' No Bid No Bid

6' No Bid No Bid

6 %' No Bid No Bid

7) Breakaway kit for K-11 Kennedy

Hydrants 5 1/4" Opening No Bid No Bid

8) Breakaway Kit for K-81A Kennedy

Hydrants 5 1/4" Opening No Bid No Bid

9) Coupling for K-81A Breakaway 5 1/4" Opening No Bid No Bid
Coupling for K-11 Breakaway 5 1/4" Opening No Bid No Bid

10) Sampling Station 3/4" X 5' No Bid Kupferle S 1,124.79

11) Tapping Gate Valves & Tapping

Sleeves Complete

4x4 No Bid American AVK | $ 871.65

6x6 No Bid American AVK | $ 1,130.83

6x4 No Bid American AVK | $ 1,080.23

8x8 No Bid American AVK | $ 1,600.29

8x6 No Bid American AVK | $ 1,495.94

8x4 No Bid American AVK | $ 1,473.33

10x10 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,500.49

10x8 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,167.20

10x6 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,075.47

10x4 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,053.59

12x12 No Bid American AVK | S 3,365.31

12x10 No Bid American AVK | $ 3,386.37

12x8 No Bid American AVK | $ 3,056.30

12x6 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,966.03

12x4 No Bid American AVK | $ 2,931.50

20x8 No Bid No Bid

20x6 No Bid No Bid

20x4 No Bid No Bid

12) Gate Valves see cut sheet

4" No Bid 565 American | S 559.66

6" No Bid 565 American | S 743.06

8" No Bid 565 American | S 1,165.16

10" No Bid 565 American | S 1,695.06

12" No Bid 565 American | S 2,094.32

13) Gate Boxes Complete

Gate Box complete No Bid No Bid

Gate Box Top No Bid No Bid

Gate Box Bottom No Bid No Bid

Gate Box Cover No Bid No Bid

13a) Valve Box Adaptor I No Bid No Bid

13b) Gate Box Bottom extra long No Bid No Bid
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
14) 1" Gate Box Risers

1" with cover No Bid No Bid

1" without cover No Bid No Bid

15) Gate Box Risers

2" with cover No Bid No Bid

2" without cover No Bid No Bid

3" with cover No Bid No Bid

3" without cover No Bid No Bid

16) Gate Box Adaptors 2 1/2" - 12

Gate Box Adaptors w/cover No Bid No Bid

Gate Box Adaptors without cover No Bid No Bid

16a) Gate Box Adaptors 2/12" - 18

Gate Box Adaptors w/cover No Bid No Bid

Gate Box Adaptors without cove No Bid No Bid

16b) Complete Megalug Gland Kits

4" No Bid Ford S 26.34
6" No Bid Ford S 32.76
8" No Bid Ford S 44.47
10" No Bid Ford S 63.53
12" No Bid Ford S 85.16
14" No Bid Ford S 135.77
16" No Bid Ford S 155.41
18" No Bid Ford S 223.32
17) Cutting-In Sleeve

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

18) Cutting-In Gate

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

19) Plug

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

20) Caps

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

21) Caps (With IP Tap)

4" with 2" IP Tap No Bid No Bid

6" with 2" IP Tap No Bid No Bid

8" with 2" IP Tap No Bid No Bid

10" with 2" IP Tap No Bid No Bid

12" with 2" IP Tap No Bid No Bid

22) Reducers

6x4 No Bid No Bid

8x4 No Bid No Bid

8x6 No Bid No Bid

10x4 No Bid No Bid

10x 6 No Bid No Bid

10x 8 No Bid No Bid

12x4 No Bid No Bid

12x6 No Bid No Bid

12x8 No Bid No Bid

12 x 10 No Bid No Bid

23) Tapping Saddles (CC)

2X Y S 17.62 | Smith Blair | $ 15.95
2x1 S 17.62 | Smith Blair | $ 15.95
4x3/4 S 22.56 | Smith Blair | $ 21.54
4x1 S 22.56 | Smith Blair | $ 21.54
4x11/4 S 28.82 | Smith Blair | $ 27.25
4x11/2 S 28.82 | Smith Blair | $ 28.11
4x2 S 28.82 | Smith Blair | $ 28.11
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
6 x 3/4 S 27.82 | Smith Blair | $ 27.58
6x1 S 27.82 | Smith Blair | $ 27.58
6x11/4 S 33.89 | Smith Blair | $ 33.55
6x11/2 S 33.89 | Smith Blair | $ 34.00
6x2 S 33.89 | Smith Blair | $ 34.00
8x3/4 S 30.46 | Smith Blair | $ 30.11
8x1 S 30.46 | Smith Blair | $ 30.11
8x11/4 S 38.01 | Smith Blair | $ 37.56
8x11/2 S 38.01 | Smith Blair | $ 37.56
8x2 S 38.01 | Smith Blair | $ 37.56
10 x 3/4 S 37.05 | Smith Blair | $ 38.91
10x 1 S 37.05 | Smith Blair | $ 38.91
10x 1 1/4 S 47.81 | Smith Blair | $ 49.54
10x11/2 S 47.81 | Smith Blair | $ 49.54
10x 2 S 47.81 | Smith Blair [ $ 49.54
12 x 3/4 S 47.08 | Smith Blair [ $ 46.68
12x1 S 47.08 | Smith Blair [ $ 46.68
12x11/2 S 59.67 | Smith Blair | $ 56.79
12x14x11/2 No Bid Smith Blair | $ 84.83
12x2 S 59.67 | Smith Blair | $ 57.94
16x11/2 No Bid Smith Blair | $ 101.22
16 x 2 No Bid Smith Blair | $ 105.16
20X Ya No Bid Smith Blair | $ 110.91
20x 1 No Bid Smith Blair | $ 110.91
20X 1% No Bid Smith Blair | $ 127.23
20x 1% No Bid Smith Blair | $ 127.23
20x 2 No Bid Smith Blair | $ 127.23
24) M.J. Hydrant Tee, Ductile Iron

6x6 No Bid No Bid

8x6 No Bid No Bid

10x6 No Bid No Bid

12x6 No Bid No Bid

25) Tees

4x4x4 No Bid No Bid
6Xx6x4 No Bid No Bid

6 X6 X6 No Bid No Bid
8x8x4 No Bid No Bid
8x8x6 No Bid No Bid
8x8x8 No Bid No Bid
10x10x 4 No Bid No Bid
10x10x 6 No Bid No Bid
10x10x8 No Bid No Bid
10x10x 10 No Bid No Bid
12x12x4 No Bid No Bid
12x12x6 No Bid No Bid
12x12x8 No Bid No Bid
12x12x10 No Bid No Bid
12x12x12 No Bid No Bid

25a) Solid Sleeves

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8” No Bid No Bid

10” No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

16” No Bid No Bid

26) Elbows

4" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid No Bid

4" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid No Bid

4" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid No Bid

4" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid No Bid

6" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid No Bid

6" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid No Bid

6" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid No Bid

6" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid No Bid

8" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid No Bid

8" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid No Bid

8" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid No Bid

8" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid No Bid

10" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid No Bid

10" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid No Bid

10" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid No Bid

10" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid No Bid

12" Elbow, 11 1/4 Bend No Bid No Bid

12" Elbow, 22 1/2 Bend No Bid No Bid

12" Elbow, 45 Bend No Bid No Bid

12" Elbow, 90 Bend No Bid No Bid

27) Ductile Iron Pipe price per foot

4" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
6" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

8" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

10" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

12" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

16" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

20" Ductile Iron Pipe No Bid No Bid

27a) Poly Bags for Pipe No Bid No Bid

28) Brass Bushings

1" x 3/4" S 2.54 | Matco Norca | $ 2.90
1 1/4” x 3/4” S 4.33 | Matco Norca | $ 4.95
11/4"x1" S 4.33 | Matco Norca | $ 4.95
11/2" x 3/4" S 6.76 | Matco Norca | $ 7.73
11/2"x1" S 5.52 | Matco Norca | $ 6.32
2" x 3/4" S 9.86 | Matco Norca | $ 11.29
2"x 1" S 9.86 | Matco Norca | $ 11.29
2"x 1 1/4" S 8.18 | Matco Norca | $ 9.37
2"x11/2" S 8.18 | Matco Norca | $ 9.37
2" 1/2" x 2" S 16.37 | Matco Norca | $ 18.74
29) Copper Tubing

3/4" $3.95/ft No Bid

1" $4.97/ft No Bid

11/4" $6.81/ft No Bid

11/2" $7.5/ft No Bid

2" $12.5/ft No Bid

30) Corporation CC X PPJ

3/4" S 41.96 | Ford S 43.08
1" S 55.19 | Ford S 56.81
11/4" S 118.08 | Ford S 121.54
11/2" S 123.68 | Ford S 126.96
2" S 204.57 | Ford S 209.99
31) Corporation IP X PPJ

3/4" S 41.96 | Ford S 43.08
1" S 55.19 | Ford S 56.81
11/4" S 118.08 | Ford S 121.54
11/2" S 123.68 | Ford S 126.96
2" S 204.57 | Ford S 209.99
32) Corporation Stop Coupling

5/8" x 3/4" S 16.88 | Ford S 17.54
3/4" x 3/4" S 16.57 | Ford S 15.69
1"x 1" S 22.62 | Ford S 23.07
1" x 3/4" No Bid Ford S 19.57
1"x 1" x 1/4" No Bid Ford S 30.76
1"x11/2 No Bid Ford S 53.30
33) Curb Boxes No Bid No Bid

34) Curb Box Covers No Bid No Bid

35) Buffalo Repair Lids No Bid No Bid

36) Service Box Plug Cover No Bid No Bid

37) Brass Plug No Bid No Bid

38) Curb Box Footpiece No Bid No Bid

39) Curb Box Riser

3" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

40) Curb Stop PPJ x PPJ

3/4" S 57.44 | Ford S 59.13
1" S 86.37 | Ford S 88.89
11/4" S 136.83 | Ford $ 140.46
11/2" S 206.65 | Ford S 212.13
2" S 290.52 | Ford S 298.23
41) Curb Stop FIP X FIP

3/4" $ 44.63 | Ford S 46.06
1" S 69.39 | Ford S 71.61
11/4" S 113.05 | Ford S 116.67
11/2" S 142.07 | Ford S 146.63
2" S 207.78 | Ford S 214.44
42) Curb Stop FIP X PPJ

3/4" S 50.44 | Ford S 52.05
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory Stiles Company, Inc. Ti-Sales, Inc.
January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m. 922 Pleasant St. 36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062 Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246 P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz Attn: Joe DeMeo

|katie@sti\esco‘com jdemeo@tisales.com
Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others
Item Model Price per each |Model Price per each
1" S 77.45 | Ford S 79.72
11/4" S 124.97 | Ford S 128.63
11/2" S 168.72 | Ford S 173.19
2" S 234.57 | Ford S 240.78
43) Female Adaptor IP X PPJ
3/4" x 3/4" S 13.68 | Ford S 14.12
1" x 3/4" S 16.28 | Ford S 16.80
11/4" x 3/4" S 19.38 | Ford S 28.85
11/2" x 3/4" No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1" S 16.12 | Ford S 16.64
1"x 1" S 18.56 | Ford S 19.16
11/4"x1" S 19.89 | Ford S 20.53
11/2"x1" No Bid No Bid
2"x1" No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1 1/4" S 27.96 | Ford S 28.93
1"x11/4" S 26.45 | Ford S 27.37
11/4"x11/4" S 33.89 | Ford S 35.07
11/2"x11/4" No Bid Ford S 43.86
2"x11/4" No Bid No Bid
3/4"x 1 1/2" No Bid No Bid
1"'x11/2" No Bid No Bid
11/4"x11/2" S 42.38 No Bid
11/2"x11/2" S 53.96 | Ford S 55.69
2"x11/2" S 57.87 | Ford S 59.73
2"x 2" S 64.25 | Ford S 66.31
21/2"X21/2" S 112.86 | Ford S 116.48
43a) Female Adaptors Brass PPJ x PPJ
3/4" x 1" S 18.40 No Bid
44) Elbows, Brass
3/4" 45 S 3.14 | Matco Norcg $ 3.58
1" 45' S 5.29 | Matco Norcg $ 6.05
11/4" 45 S 8.46 | Matco Norcd $ 9.69
11/2" 45 S 10.61 | Matco Norcd $ 12.00
2" 45' S 17.20 | Matco Norcd $ 18.80
3/4"  221/2 No Bid No Bid
1" 22 1/2' No Bid No Bid
11/4" 221/2 No Bid No Bid
11/2" 221/2 No Bid No Bid
2" 22 1/2' No Bid No Bid
3/4"  111/4 No Bid No Bid
1" 11 1/4' No Bid No Bid
11/4" 1114 No Bid No Bid
11/2" 1114 No Bid No Bid
2" 11 1/4 No Bid No Bid
34" 90 S 3.14 | Matco Norcg $ 3.58
1" 90’ S 4.84 | Matco Norcg $ 5.54
11/4" 90 S 7.69 | Matco Norcg $ 8.80
11/2" 90 S 13.36 | Matco Norcd $ 10.99
2" 90' S 15.63 | Matco Norcg $ 17.89
44a) Elbow Brass, PPJ X PPJ
3/4" S 23.88 No Bid
1" S 26.29 No Bid
11/2" S 84.43 No Bid
2" S 170.79 No Bid
45) Male Adaptor, IP X PPJ
3/4" S 13.00 | Ford S 13.45
1" S 15.40 | Ford S 15.93
11/4" S 29.45 | Ford S 30.47
11/2" S 42.19 | Ford S 43.66
2" S 61.47 | Ford S 63.61
46) Nipples, Brass
34" x 2" S 1.91 | Matco Norcg $ 1.99
1"x2" S 2.75 | Matco Norcg $ 2.88
11/4"x2" S 3.85 | Matco Norcg $ 3.93
11/2"x2" S 4.71 | Matco Norcg $ 4.81
2"x2" S 6.67 No Bid
21/2" x 2" S 17.60 No Bid
3/4" x 4" S 3.33 | Matco Norcg $ 3.39
1"x 4 S 4.82 | Matco Norcg $ 4.91
11/4"x4" S 6.78 | Matco Norcg $ 6.93
11/2"x 4" S 8.45 | Matco Norcd $ 8.63
2"x 4" S 10.87 | Matco Norcg $ 10.57
2" x 4" S 23.18 | Matco Norcg $ 22.56
3/4" x 6" S 4.86 | Matco Norcd $ 5.29
1"x 6" S 7.09 | Matco Norcg $ 7.25
11/4"x6" S 9.89 | Matco Norcg $ 10.10
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
11/2"x6" S 12.48 | Matco Norcd $ 12.75
2" x 6" S 16.05 | Matco Norcd $ 16.40
2" X 6" S 32.25 | Matco Norcd $ 32.96
3/4" x 2" S 1.91 | Matco Norcd $ 2.07
1"x 2" S 2.75 | Matco Norcd $ 3.00
11/4"x 2" S 3.85 | Matco Norcd $ 4.19
11/2"x2" S 4.71 | Matco Norcg $ 5.13
2"x 2" S 6.67 No Bid

3/4" x 4" S 3.33 | Matco Norcd $ 3.39
1" x 4" S 4.82 | Matco Norcg $ 4,91
11/4" x 4" S 6.78 | Matco Norcd $ 6.93
11/2"x 4" S 8.45 | Matco Norcg $ 8.63
2" x 4" S 10.87 | Matco Norcg $ 10.57
3/4" x 6" S 4.86 | Matco Norcg $ 5.29
1"x 6" S 7.09 | Matco Norcg $ 7.25
11/4"x 6" S 9.89 | Matco Norcg $ 10.10
11/2"x6" S 12.48 | Matco Norcg $ 12.75
2" x 6" S 16.05 | Matco Norcd $ 16.40
47) Nipples, close, Brass (Threaded)

3/4" S 1.51 | Matco Norcd $ 1.91
1" S 2.23 | Matco Norcd $ 2.60
11/4" S 3.37 | Matco Norcd $ 3.93
11/2" S 4.38 | Matco Norcg $ 4.77
2" S 6.67 | Matco Norcd $ 7.27
48) Plug, Brass, CC

3/4" S 6.66 | Ford S 8.15
1" S 9.71 | Ford S 11.88
11/4" No Bid No Bid

11/2" S 26.29 | Ford S 32.18
2" S 45.03 | Ford S 55.12
49) Plug, Brass (IP)

3/4" S 1.83 No Bid

1" S 2.42 No Bid

11/4" S 3.60 No Bid

11/2" S 4.59 No Bid

2" S 7.24 No Bid

50) Coupling, Reducer

1" x 3/4" S 5.07 | Matco Norcd $ 6.51
1 1/4" x 3/4" S 8.18 | Matco Norcg $ 10.49
11/2" x 3/4" S 11.64 | Matco Norcd $ 14.93
2" x 3/4" S 17.32 | Matco Norcd $ 20.32
11/4"x1" S 8.18 | Matco Norcg $ 9.84
11/2"x1" S 10.34 | Matco Norcd $ 12.44
2"x 1" S 17.32 | Matco Norcd $ 20.32
11/2"x11/4" S 10.34 | Matco Norcd $ 12.44
2"x 1 1/4" S 15.37 | Matco Norcd $ 17.60
2"x11/2" S 15.37 | Matco Norcd $ 17.60
2"x 2" S 13.47 No Bid

51) Cast Coupling - 411 (Body length 6")

3/4" S 20.54 | Smith Blair | $ 19.25
1" S 22.38 | Smith Blair | $ 19.92
11/4" S 25.31 | Smith Blair | $ 20.86
11/2" S 26.10 | Smith Blair | $ 24.90
2" S 36.43 | Smith Blair | $ 28.21
51a) Hymax Coupling

2" S 97.49 No Bid

4" S 168.07 No Bid

6" S 222.59 No Bid

8” S 251.31 No Bid

10” S 316.96 No Bid

10".s. S 341.84 No Bid

12" S 374.12 No Bid

12"0.s. $ 456.52 No Bid

14" No Bid No Bid

14"0.s. No Bid No Bid

16" No Bid No Bid

18" No Bid No Bid

20" No Bid No Bid

24" No Bid No Bid

52) Cast Coupling 441

4" S 47.51 | Smith Blair | $ 55.44
6" S 63.14 | Smith Blair | $ 71.09
8" S 84.27 | Smith Blair | $ 89.87
10" S 125.48 | Smith Blair | $ 124.78
12" S 144.78 | Smith Blair | $ 150.24
14" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 252.78
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
16" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 336.13
20" No Bid No Bid

53) Transition Coupling DI to AC (All by 6")

4" S 53.46 No Bid

6" S 72.94 No Bid

8" S 92.33 No Bid

10" S 127.01 No Bid

12" S 151.33 No Bid

54) Transition Coupling AC to DI

2"x 6" No Bid No Bid

55) Full Circle Clamp

2" x71/2" S 37.13 | Smith Blair | $ 37.16
4" x71/2" S 48.24 | Smith Blair | $ 47.64
6" x 7 1/2" S 50.43 | Smith Blair | $ 55.54
8"x 71/2" S 59.12 | Smith Blair | $ 64.95
12" x 7 1/2" S 92.58 | Smith Blair [ $ 100.02
20" x 7 ¥%" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 346.74
4" x 12 1/2" S 67.06 | Smith Blair | $ 73.10
6" x 12 1/2" S 80.62 | Smith Blair | $ 89.03
8"x 12 1/2" S 94.80 | Smith Blair [ $ 125.23
10" x 12 %" S 127.86 | Smith Blair | $ 132.32
12" x 12 35" S 148.09 | Smith Blair | $ 160.22
14" x 12 ¥%" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 418.95
16" x 12 1" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 439.59
18" x 12 ¥%" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 448.31
20" x 12 ¥%" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 507.82
24" x 12 ¥%" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 793.47
4" x 20" S 125.60 | Smith Blair | $ 147.04
6" x 20" S 146.83 | Smith Blair | $ 153.98
8" x 20" S 158.64 | Smith Blair | $ 173.03
10" x 20" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 211.07
12" x 20" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 249.02
14" x 20" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 564.96
16" x 20" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 580.82
18" x 20" No Bid No Bid

20" x 20" No Bid No Bid

24" x 20" No Bid No Bid

10" x 10" S 110.45 No Bid

14" x 10" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 347.53
16" x 10" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 366.60
20" x 10" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 416.10
4" x 15" S 81.79 | Smith Blair | $ 81.19
6" x 15" S 102.67 | Smith Blair | $ 98.60
8" x 15" S 105.08 | Smith Blair | $ 119.98
10" x 15" S 142.67 | Smith Blair | $ 154.49
12" x 15" S 177.55 | Smith Blair | $ 220.00
14" x 15" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 418.95
16" x 15" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 439.59
18" x 15" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 537.96
20 x 15" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 609.38
24" x 15" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 952.17
4" x 24" S 160.09 No Bid

6" x 24" S 187.62 No Bid

8" x 24" S 210.23 No Bid

10" x 24" S 307.95 No Bid

12" x 24" S 340.43 No Bid

14" x 24" No Bid No Bid

16" x 24" No Bid No Bid

18" x 24" No Bid No Bid

20" x 24" No Bid No Bid

24" x 24" No Bid No Bid

56) Bell Joint Leak Clamp

4" S 78.68 | Smith Blair | $ 98.89
6" S 86.64 | Smith Blair [ $ 108.90
8" S 119.84 | Smith Blair | $ 150.47
10" S 150.24 | Smith Blair | $ 189.08
12" S 162.97 | Smith Blair | $ 204.50
14" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 711.19
16" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 319.33
20" No Bid Smith Blair | $ 515.32
57) Union, 3 Piece

3/4" S 15.84 | Ford S 16.80
1" S 18.11 | Ford S 19.21
19" S 31.28 | Ford S 33.18
1" S 60.62 | Ford S 64.30
2" S 81.83 | Ford S 86.80
58) Pipe Coupling, IP X IP
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Bid #23-21 Water Dept. Stock Inventory

Stiles Company, Inc.

Ti-Sales, Inc.

January 13, 2021 @ 2:30 p.m.

922 Pleasant St.

36 Hudson Rd.

Norwood, MA 02062

Sudbury, MA 01776

P: 800-426-6246

P: 800-225-4616

Attn: Katie Kasowitz

Attn: Joe DeMeo

Price Per Ft. for Pipe. Per each all others

|katie@stilesco.com

jdemeo@tisales.com

ltem Model Price per each |Model Price per each
3/4" S 2.54 | Matco Norcd $ 3.47
1" S 3.86 | Matco Norcd $ 5.30
11/4" S 6.02 | Matco Norcd $ 7.72
11/2" S 8.18 | Matco Norcg $ 9.60
2" S 13.47 | Matco Norcd $ 15.43
2 1/2" No Bid Matco Norcg $ 25.54
59) Ball Valves, FIP x FIP

3/4" S 6.20 | Apollo S 37.99
1" S 10.18 | Apollo S 47.85
1Y, No Bid Apollo S 80.24
11/2" S 25.65 | Apollo S 102.47
2" S 35.93 | Apollo S 122.14
60) Caps, Brass

3/4" S 2.02 | Matco Norcd $ 3.00
1" S 3.17 | Matco Norcd $ 4.69
11/4" S 4.82 | Matco Norcg $ 7.14
11/2" S 6.51 | Matco Norcd $ 8.94
2" S 11.05 | Matco Norcd $ 15.19
61) Tees, Brass, I.P. Thread

3/4" S 3.86 | Matco Norcg $ 5.71
1" S 6.85 | Matco Norcg $ 10.14
114" S 9.60 | Matco Norcd $ 11.85
11/2" S 13.21 | Matco Norcd $ 16.29
2" S 21.65 | Matco Norcd $ 26.69
62) Tees, Brass, PPJ x PPJ X IP

2"x2"'x3/4" S 102.67 | Ford S 106.53
63) Foster Adaptor with Kit

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

64) Rod clamps

4" No Bid No Bid

6" No Bid No Bid

8" No Bid No Bid

10" No Bid No Bid

12" No Bid No Bid

65) 3/4" Duc lugs No Bid No Bid

66) Threaded rod couplings, rod clamp

washer and hex nuts

5/8" x 6' No Bid No Bid

3/4" x 6' No Bid No Bid

66a) Tie bolts

5/8" x 3" No Bid No Bid

3/4" x 4" No Bid No Bid

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR A PERIOD OH

Copy to: Karen Conard, City Manager
Judie Belanger, Finance Director

Peter Rice, Public Works Director

Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director
Jim Tow, General Foreman

Denise Carpenter, Purchasing Coordinator
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